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Forecasted income represents income that has been agreed with the client. Fee from modifications is only recognised once it has been 
agreed with the client. 

Measuring the outcome of the performance obligations can take time due to the multi-year lifespan of the Company’s contracts. Assuming 
the project is forecasted to make a profit, the Company recognises revenue only to the extent of the costs incurred until the project reaches 
50% complete on a standard risk project and 95% on a high risk project. Management have reviewed projects across the Arup Group and 
have used their judgement to establish these percentages. Once a non-onerous project reaches 50% / 95% complete, profit is recognised in 
line with its percentage completion. 

Impairment of trade receivables and contract assets (estimates and judgements) 

The Company makes an estimate of the recoverable value of trade receivables and contract assets. When assessing impairment, 
management considers factors including the credit rating of the receivables, the ageing profile of receivables and historical experience. The 
Company applies the simplified approach for IFRS 9 when measuring expected credit losses which uses a lifetime expected loss allowance 
for all trade receivables and contract assets. See notes 16 and 17 for the net carrying amounts of contract assets and trade receivables and 
their associated impairment provisions. 

Due to the nature of the Company, it has significant receivables due from Arup Group undertakings. When assessing impairment, 
management have considered inter-group agreements and historical experience.  

During the year ending 31 March 2023, the Company made a one-off specific impairment on receivables due from a related party (note 8). 
Impairing such an asset is rare and as such it is considered exceptional for the Company. Apart from this specific impairment, the expected 
credit loss on amounts due from Arup Group undertakings is deemed to be immaterial. 

Lease accounting (judgements) 

In determining the lease term, management considers all facts and circumstances that create an economic incentive to exercise an extension 
option, or not exercise a termination option. Extension options are only included in the lease term if the lease is reasonably certain to be 
extended (or not terminated). In light of the impact COVID-19 has had on Arup employees working from home, where a lease has the 
option to extend management have made the judgement that it will not be extended unless there is evidence otherwise.  

Legal claims (estimates and judgements) 

From time to time the Company receives claims from clients with regards to work performed on projects. Professional indemnity insurance 
and / or project insurance policies are in place for such situations. Significant judgement is required to determine whether a provision 
liability should be put in place for these claims. Accounting estimates are made to value these claims utilising both internal and external 
sources as well as the result of past experience. Assumptions are used in making these estimates and as such subsequent events may mean 
that they prove to be inaccurate, with an adjustment made in a future year. The Company recognises that accounting standards require that 
professional indemnity insurance should be recognised as a reimbursement only when it is virtually certain that the reimbursement will be 
received. No separate disclosure is made of the detail of such claims or proceedings, or the costs recovered by insurance, as to do so could 
seriously prejudice the position of the Company. 

4. Revenue 

The total revenue recognised in the year that was included in contract liabilities at the beginning of the year was £44,221k (2023: 
£58,155k). The total revenue recognised in the year from performance obligations satisfied (or partially satisfied) in previous years was 
£242,278k (2023: £244,316k). 

 2024 2023 

 £'000 £'000 

Revenue by destination   

Asia 287,358 285,324 

United Kingdom 5,747 6,232 

Americas 398 390 

Australasia 203 309 

Middle East & Africa 178 22 

Europe 56 153 

 293,940 292,430 
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Impairment loss on amounts due from Arup Group undertakings 

During the year ending 31 March 2023, the Company impaired a £7,961k asset due from Arup International Consultants (Shanghai) Co., 
Limited, a related party. Impairing such an asset is rare and as such it is considered exceptional for the Company. This impairment loss on 
amounts due from Arup Group undertakings has been included in ‘net reversal of impairment losses / (impairment losses) on financial and 
contract assets’ in the income statement.  

9. Net finance costs 

 2024 2023 

 £'000 £'000 

Interest expense on borrowings (1,030) (113) 

Lease liabilities  (238) (519) 

Interest expense - Arup Group undertakings (827) (192) 

Net finance costs on net post-employment benefit liabilities - (0) 

Total finance costs (2,095) (824) 

   

Interest receivable on short-term bank deposits 97 22 

Interest receivable - Arup Group undertakings 225 96 

Net finance income on net post-employment benefit liabilities 7 - 

Total finance income 329 118 

Net finance costs (1,766) (706) 

 

Interest due to / from Arup Group undertakings is in regard to the Arup Group’s cash pooling facility and short term inter-group loans 
provided to / by the Company.  

10. Income tax credit /(charge) 

(a) Analysis of total income tax (credit) / charge 

 2024 2023 

 £'000 £'000 

Current income tax   

 Non-UK: current income tax on profits for the year 284 423 

 Non-UK: adjustment in respect of prior years - (139) 

Total current income tax 284 284 

   

Deferred income tax (note 22)   

 Origination and reversal of temporary differences (2,967) 66 

 Under provision of deferred income tax in respect of prior years 322 - 

Total deferred income tax (2,645) 66 

   

Total income tax (credit) / charge (2,361) 350 
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17. Trade and other receivables 

 2024 2023 

 £'000 £'000 

Trade receivables - net 17,562 19,338 

Amounts due from Arup Group undertakings 42,041 26,624 

Other receivables 10,376 2,868 

Prepayments and accrued income 318 526 

 70,297 49,356 

 

The directors consider that the carrying value of trade and other receivables approximates to their fair value. 

Trade receivables 2024 2023 

 £'000 £'000 

Trade receivables 18,253 19,975 

Loss allowance (691) (637) 

 17,562 19,338 

 

Amounts due from Arup Group undertakings 

Amounts due from Arup Group undertakings are unsecured, have no date of repayment and are repayable on demand. Where inter-group 
loans have been provided, interest is accrued on inter-group loans with a rate in the range of 2-8.25% (2023: 1-8%).  

The Company has assessed the ability of Arup Group companies to meet their inter-group liabilities. Based on this review the expected 
credit losses of amounts due from Arup Group undertakings is deemed to be nil (2023: nil). 

During the year ending 31 March 2023, the Company made a one-off specific impairment of £7,961k on receivables due from Arup 
International Consultants (Shanghai) Co., Limited, a related party (note 8). Impairing such an asset is rare and as such it is considered 
exceptional for the Company. 

18. Cash and cash equivalents 

 2024 2023 

 £'000 £'000 

Cash at bank and in hand 24,391 16,796 

 24,391 16,796 

 

The Arup Group operates a cash pooling arrangement to centralise funds and enable optimal cash management. The Company is part of 
this multiple unit group and recognises its own cash pooling in its financial statements. The cash pooling arrangement is managed by a 
related party within the Arup Group and balances are settled periodically. 

 
















